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Section 1: Introduction 
 
This Final Generic Environmental Impact Statement (GEIS) has been prepared 
on behalf of the Town of Putnam Valley Town Board for the adoption and 
implementation of the Town of Putnam Valley Comprehensive Plan.  
 
In accordance with the New York State Environmental Quality Review Act (6 
NYCRR Part 617), the following elements of the SEQRA process have been 
undertaken: 
 

 The Town of Putnam Valley Town Board, as Lead Agency, accepted the 
Draft Generic Environmental Impact Statement (DGEIS) as complete on 
October 17, 2007. A Notice of Completion was prepared and filed as 
required by law. 

 
 A public hearing was held by the Town Board on the DGEIS and was 

opened and closed on November 7, 2007. A 10-day written comment 
period was established and ended on November 19, 2007. 

 
This purpose of this FGEIS is to respond to comments received at the public 
hearing and to written comments received during the comment period. As noted 
above, a public hearing was held by the Town Board on November 7, 2007; 
however, no formal comments were made and the public hearing was therefore 
closed (See Public Hearing Transcript in Appendix A). The Town Board received 
one written comment letter, which is responded to in Section 2 below. 
 
Section 2: Response to Comments  
 
The following comments were made by Councilman Robert Tendy and were 
received by the Town Board on November 19, 2007 (see Appendix A). 
 
Comment 1:  
 
The Comprehensive Plan includes a recommendation to “establish a maximum 
development density of 1 home per 3 acres and redefine buildable area 
requirements.”  While I agree that the R-1 and R-2 Zoning Districts should be 
rezoned to 1 home per 3 acres, the recommended buildable area requirements 
appear to be very definitive (page 31). I recommend that the language provided 
in this section be revised to allow for more “wiggle room” so that as we refine and 
finalize the zoning amendments next year, the decision about buildable area 
requirements is not hamstrung by the very specific recommendation provided in 
the Plan. 
 
Response 1: 
 
Comment noted. Buildable area is defined by subtracting certain environmental 
constraints (wetlands, steep slopes, floodplains, etc.) from a parcel’s gross lot 
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area. The current zoning code requires that each new lot in the R-2 and R-3 
District contain at least 30,000 sq. ft. of buildable area and that lots within the R-1 
District contain at least 20,000 sq. ft. of buildable area. Regarding limiting 
proposed development with the buildable area, the current zoning code states: 
“the intent of the Zoning Code is that buildings, driveways, and site amenities be 
located primarily within the buildable area.” 
 
The recommendation in Comprehensive Plan pertaining to buildable area is very 
specific and will restrict future zoning amendments regarding buildable area. As 
currently written, the Comprehensive Plan recommendation will require the Town 
to implement buildable area laws that require each lot to have 1.5 acres (65,340 
sq. ft.) of buildable area and that mandate that 90% of proposed development be 
located within that buildable area. The Town Board should determine whether the 
language pertaining to buildable area is too definitive and whether the language 
should be made to allow for more flexibility.  
 
Regardless of whether the recommendation pertaining to buildable area is 
modified to allow for more flexibility, there is an error within this same paragraph 
that should be changed prior to the Plan’s adoption. The first sentence of this 
paragraph states: “a review of recently approved subdivision in Town reveals an 
average of 1.5 acres of disturbed area per building lot.” Although a review of 
recent subdivisions was conducted, the average disturbed area is less than 1 
acre. The first sentence of the first full paragraph on Page 31 should be revised 
to read: “a review of recently approved subdivision in Town reveals an average 
disturbed area of less than 1 acre per building lot.” 
 
Comment 2:  
 
Though the final version of the plan does now include some positive 
recommendations about economic development (pages 20-22), there are still 
additional suggestions that could be added to balance the plan’s treatment of 
conservation and sound business growth.  For example, though the plan does 
not prohibit the Town from pre-planning for commercial development, it also does 
not recommend this type of pro-active effort. The Town could select properties 
that are conducive to commercial activity and prepare these sites for 
development by pre-approving plans for the specific types of uses and sizes of 
buildings that are desired and consistent with our goals.  We can initiate the 
environmental review or address infrastructure needs to make such sites ready 
for development.   By reducing the time it takes for a developer to go through the 
Planning Board review process, the Town will create an incentive for appropriate 
businesses to locate in the Town.  
 
Response 2: 
 
Comment noted. This type of pre-planning has worked well in other communities 
and could be implemented in Putnam Valley to create an incentive for business 
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to locate in Town. Although the Comprehensive Plan does not provide a specific 
recommendation relating to this method of pre-planning, it does not specifically 
recommend against it. After a review of the Draft Comprehensive Plan, it is 
understood that if in the future the Town desires to implement a program similar 
to what is described above (Comment 2), such a program would not be 
inconsistent with the Comprehensive Plan and therefore no modification to the 
Draft Comprehensive Plan is necessary.  
 
Comment 3:  
 
The Comprehensive Plan states that many of our existing commercial nodes are 
constrained by steep slopes, wetlands, and watercourses. Most of the less 
constrained land is proposed to be residentially zoned and will therefore not be 
used for commercial purposes in the future.  Since we do not really need more 
residential development, it might make sense to provide other options for owners 
of developable property.  I recommend that we consider including Planned Unit 
Development (PUD) or similar techniques in our Comprehensive Plan and 
Zoning Code.  A PUD is a floating zoning district that is used to promote mixed 
use development. We can develop PUD regulations that provide flexibility in 
design and building placement and that promote an attractive environment that 
incorporates a variety of uses, densities, and unit types. Since PUD’s are 
established as floating zones (approvable by the Town Board only after thorough 
review), these can be used to take advantage of some of the more developable 
lands in the residential zoning districts that would otherwise be developed for 
residential purposes only.  Though the comprehensive plan does not prohibit the 
use of PUDs, it also does not suggest the use of this technique.  Perhaps it 
should.  The current draft of the zoning amendments does not include language 
about PUDs.  This should definitely be added to the zoning law.    
 
Response 3: 
 
Comment noted. Planned Unit Development (PUD) is a planning tool that is used 
throughout New York State (and beyond) to encourage and regulate mixed-use 
development. As noted above, the Comprehensive Plan does not provide a 
specific recommendation regarding PUD’s; however, it does not specifically 
recommend against it. Although PUD regulations would certainly need to be 
spelled out within the Town’s Zoning Code, it is believed that the implementation 
of PUD regulations, if desired in the future by the Town Board, would not be 
inconsistent with the Comprehensive Plan.  
 
Please note that the comment letter received by Councilman Tendy includes 
additional comments that are specific to the Draft Zoning Code. As these 
comments appear to be technical comments on the draft ordinance and not on 
the Comprehensive Plan or GEIS and as the Draft Zoning Code and Subdivision 
Regulations are not currently being considered for adoption, these comments are 
not being addressed at this time. Mr. Tendy’s comments, however, should be 
fully responded to prior to the adoption of these laws. 
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